EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	ES:			•
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCFR002S*	ds	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$	\$	\$ <u> </u>	\$
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 181.00	\$ 2.99	\$ 50 15 AN	45 181.00
HM0019SA	\$ 181.00	s 2.99	\$ 50 EFAN	1 \$ 181.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 253.00 \$ 2.99	\$ 88.00	\$ 341.00
PRDS0001*	\$\$	\$	\$
	AFZAL - VP er's Name and Title (Print or Type	e)	
Company Name Nor	ABC Trans Corp P.O Box 7804 th Brunswick, NJ 08902	PH: 848	-264-4348
Company Addres	ss and Telephone Number		
Authorized Sign	ntyre		5/30/23 Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u>:S:</u>			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$ 225.00	\$ 2.97	\$_60.00	\$ 285.00
ALCFR002S*	\$ 247.00	\$ <u>0.10</u>	\$ 50.00	\$297.00
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$ 243.0	\$ <u>200</u>	\$ 50.00	\$ 2.93.00
CPC00001*	\$ 233.00	, <u>\$ 2.50</u>	\$ 55.00	\$ <u>288.00</u>
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 83.00	\$ 0.50	\$ <i>N A</i>	\$ <i>83.00</i>
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 97.00	\$ 0.50	\$_ <i>NA</i> _	\$ <u>97.00</u>

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 237.00 \$ 2	1.00 \$ 50.0	00 \$ <u>287.0</u> 0
PRDS0001*	\$245.00 \$ 2	00 \$ 50.0	00 \$295.00
Nabi Authorized Bidde	Shehata — er's Name and Title (Prin	owner	
Angile	STrans	732-0	801 -9189 925 -7363
		7	
34 Mars Company Address	s and Telephone Number	Brigge, 1	18.08857
	Vahi		06.01.23
Authorized Signa	ture		Date

Bright Start Transport

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUT	ES:			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$ <u>386.00</u>	\$ <u>0.99</u>	\$ <u>60-00</u>	\$ 446.00
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$ 436.00	\$ D-99	\$ D.OD	\$ 436-00
CLLAD001*	\$351.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 65.00	\$ 416.00
CPC00001*	\$ 389.00	\$ D.99	\$ 65 00	\$ 454.00
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 293.00	\$ D-99	\$ 0.00	\$ 293.00
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ <u>341.00</u>	\$ D.99	\$ 0.00	\$ 341.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 280-00	\$ 0.99	\$65.00	\$345.00			
PRDS0001*	\$ 27600	\$ 0.99	\$ 65.00	\$ 341.00			
Marianette Liriano Managing partner Authorized Bidder's Name and Title (Print or Type)							
Bright Start Tra	nsport LLC						
Company Name							
491 Neville St F Company Address	Perth Amboy, N ss and Telephone I	Number					
1	M-		<u> </u>	5/30/2023			
Authorized Signa	ature	-		Date			

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost	
SINGLE ROUT	ES:				
ALCBY001	\$ 240	\$\	s 40	\$ 280	
ALCED002*	\$_190_	\$\	\$ 40	\$ <u>230</u>	
ALCFR002S*	\$ 290	\$	\$ 50	\$ 340	
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$	
CLLAD001*	\$ 220	\$\	\$_50_	\$ 270	
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$ 210	\$1	\$_56	\$ 260	
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ \50	\$ <u>\</u>	\$ 40	\$ 190	
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 150	\$\	s 40	\$ <u>190</u>	

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

<u>NAVB0001*</u>	\$ 190	\$ <u>2,50</u>	\$ <u>70°</u>	s 200°°°	
PRDS0001*	\$ 190.00	\$ 2,50	\$ 70.00	\$ 260.00	
Azmi >	bussef_	<i>O</i> u	٥٨٠		
Authorized Bidde	er's Name and Titl	e (Print or Typ	oe)	•	
Chris Company Name	Trans L	<u> </u>			
36 Dog Company Addres	s and Telephone N	East B Jumber	runswick	21880 CN,	
am	45			5/30/25	
Authorized Signa	ture			Date	

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUT	ES:			
ALCBY001	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
ALCED002*	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$ <u>NO BID</u>
ALCFR002S*	\$_NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
ALCKD002	\$_NO_BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$_NO BID
CLLAD001*	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
CPC00001*	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ NO BID	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-12

NAVB0001*	\$ <u>3</u> 90	\$ 0.01	\$ <u>65</u>	\$_455				
PRDS0001*	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO BID	\$ NO B	ID			
Jason Schad, N	Manager of Com	mercial Developmer	nt		<u> </u>			
Authorized Bidde	Authorized Bidder's Name and Title (Print or Type)							
Durham School S	Services, L.P.							
Company Name								
2601 Navistar Dr	ive, Lisle, IL 605	32 (630) 821-5400)					
Company Addres	s and Telephor	ie Number						
166		By: Durham Holding its General Partner	II, L.L.C.,	5/31/2023				
Authorized Signa	iture				Date			

Total Per

13 BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*

Route

Route

 Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Aide/Attendant

No.	Per Diem	Adj Cost	Per Diem Cost	Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTI	ES:			
ALCBY001	\$218,00	\$0.00	\$ NA	\$ <u>218.00</u>
ALCED002*	\$267.00	\$	\$ 70.00	\$ <u>337.00</u>
ALCFR002S*	\$298,00	\$	\$ 80.00	\$378.00
ALCKD002	\$ 194.00	\$	\$_ \/A _	\$ <i>194.00</i>
CLLAD001*	\$ <u>189.00</u>	\$	\$ 50.00	\$ <i>239.00</i>
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$ <u>218.00</u>	\$	\$ 70.00	\$ 2 88.00
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 89.00	\$	\$ <u></u>	\$ <u>89.00</u>
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 79.00	\$ <u> </u>	\$ <u>\UA</u>	\$ 79.00

Inc/Dec

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 154.00	\$0.00	\$60.00	\$214.00
PRDS0001*	\$ <i>218.00</i>	\$0.00	\$ 70.00	\$288.00
Samir Bes Authorized Bidde)	
Company Name	PO Box 955 ast brunswick, NJ	00016	MMANUEL TRANS Tel: 7329109 Fax: 7322896	00 01
Company Address	and Telephone N			
- Pour B	Bott			5/30/23
Authorized Signat	ure			Date

Irvin Raphael

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	CS:			
ALCBY001	\$ NO BID	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$ <u>341</u>	\$ <u>1.95</u>	\$ <u>110</u>	\$ <u>451</u>
ALCFR002S*	\$ NO BID	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$ NO BID	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$ <u>341</u>	\$ <u>1.95</u>	\$ <u>110</u>	\$ 451
CPC00001*	\$ 363	\$ <u>1.95</u>	\$ <u>110</u>	\$ <u>473</u>
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ NO BID	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$_NO BID	\$	\$	\$

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 35 of 40

Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-12

NAVB0001*	\$ <u>363</u>	\$ <u>1.95</u>	<u>\$ 110</u>	\$ <u>473</u>	
PRDS0001*	\$ <u>363</u>	\$ <u>1.95</u>	\$ <u>110</u>	\$ <u>473</u>	
Amy Raphae	Corporate Treat	asurer			-
Authorized Bidder	r's Name and Title	e (Print or Ty	pe)	•	
Irvin Raphae Company Name					-
√ 550 Old Stag	je Road , East B	Brunswick, NJ	08816 732-25	51-2447	_
Company Address Authorized Signat	and Telephone N		i	5/30/00c	}
- 101-101-101-101-101-101-101-101-101-10	. '				

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem		Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTI	ES:			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$ 245.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 58	\$_303
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$ 251.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 50.00	\$ 301.00
CPC00001*	\$ 230.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 45.00	\$ 275.00
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 251.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 20	\$ <u>251</u>
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 251.00	\$ 0.99	\$	\$ 251.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001* \$ 245.00 \$ 0.99 \$ 46.00 \$<u>291.00</u> PRDS0001* \$ 0.99 \$ 291.00 \$ 245.00 \$ 46.00 Fidelina Estevez MANAGER Authorized Bidder's Name and Title (Print or Type) K&D BUS SERVICE LLC Company Name 11 main st Somerset, NJ 08873, 347 210 7374 Company Address and Telephone Number 06/02/23 Authorized Signature Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u>S:</u>			•
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$_180 -	\$ 1/m/E	\$ 35 –	\$_215
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$ <u>200</u>	\$ 1/mile	\$_38	\$ 238
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$ <u>200</u>	\$ 1/mile	\$ <u>44</u>	\$ <u>244</u>
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ <u>98</u>	\$ 1/mile	\$	\$ <u>98</u>
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 98	\$ 1.1 mile	\$	\$ <u>98</u>

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

		\$ 1/mile			_
PRDS0001*	\$_200_	\$ 1/mile	\$_45_	\$ <u>245</u>	
Authorized Bidder's Company Name	A Me		manag	er	
27 windsone Company Address	g cir Gos ind Telephone N	<u>t Brunsu.</u> Tumber	ck, 15	732-37	<u>'z-545</u> 5
	aged				6-2023 Date

Mercy Transportation Inc. 13 Major Rd, Monmouth Junction, NJ 08852

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u> 2S:</u>			,
ALCBY001	\$ 398.00	\$ 2.00	\$_0.00	\$ 398.00
ALCED002*	\$_398.00	\$ 2.00	\$_85.00	\$ 483.00
ALCFR002S*	\$ 340.00	\$ 2.00	\$_79.00	\$ 419.00
ALCKD002	\$_495.00	\$_2,00	\$_0.00	\$ 495.00
CLLAD001*	\$ 398.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 483.00
CPC00001*	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

Mercy Transportation Inc.

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTI	ES:			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$ 250	\$ 1.90	\$ 75	\$ 325
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$ 270	s 1.90	\$ 75	\$ 345
CPC00001*	\$ 270	\$ 1.90	\$ 75	\$ <u>345</u>
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 215	s 1.90	\$	\$ 215
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ 260	\$ 1.90	\$	\$ 260_

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 300 \$ 1.90 \$	75 \$ 375
PRDS0001*	\$ 300 \$ 1.90 \$	75 \$ 375
<u>Clique</u>	Boebas - President r's Name and Title (Print or Type)	
	s Teausportation	
Company Name	•	NY MAR
Company Addres	s and Telephone Number	N) 0100
Authorized Signa	Care Borbary	6/1/23 Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u>'S:</u>			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCFR002S*	\$ <u>260.00</u>	\$ <u>0.49</u>	\$ <u>65.00</u>	\$ <u>325.00</u>
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 139.00	\$ <u>0.49</u>	\$ <u>65.00</u>	\$ <u>139.00</u>
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ <u>139.00</u>	\$ <u>0.49</u>	\$ 65.00	\$ 139.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$	\$	\$	<u> </u>
PRDS0001*	\$ <u>299.00</u>	\$ <u>0.49</u>	\$ <u>85.00</u>	\$ <u>384.00</u>
Daniel Da Fonse	eca - Supervisor			
Authorized Bidde	er's Name and Ti	tle (Print or T	ype)	
		·		
ROAD TO SUC	CESS LLC			
Company Name	=	TACAMI VIII A TITLE		
281 Summerhil	I Rd. Suite 202	East Brunswi	ck NJ 08816	908-477-5434-Dispatch
Company Address	ss and Telephone	Number		
121	4	- .		6/1/2023
Authorized Signa	ifure			Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u>'S:</u>			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$	\$	<u>\$</u>	\$
ALCFR002S*	\$ 500.00	\$ 8.00	\$ <u>80.00</u>	\$ 580.00
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 250.00	\$ 8.00	\$_30.00	\$ 280.00
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$_280.00_	\$ 8.00	\$ 30.00	\$310.00

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 35 of 40

Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services

Bid Number 2023-12

<u>NAVB0001*</u>	\$ <u>333.00</u>	\$ <u>8.00</u>	\$ 30.00	\$ <u>36</u>	<u> </u>			
PRDS0001*	\$	\$	\$\$	\$				
Mohamed A Eltayeb Authorized Bidder's Name and Title (Print or Type)								
Sunset Tran Company Name	sportation LLC		·					
254 Pinelli DR Piscataway NJ 08854 /// 732-763-6164 Company Address and Telephone Number								
					6/2/2023			
Authorized Signa	iture				Date			

Taykz Tyme

BID SHEET

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost			
SINGLE ROUTES:							
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$			
ALCED002*	\$ <u>325</u>	\$ 1.25	\$ <u>65</u>	\$ <u>390.00</u>			
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$			
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$			
CLLAD001*	\$ <u>285</u>	\$ 1.25	\$ <u>65</u>	\$ <u>350.00</u>			
<u>CPC00001*</u>	s 295	\$ 1.25	s 65	\$360.00			
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 275	\$ <u>1.25</u>	\$ 65	\$ 340.00			
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ <u>275</u>	\$ 1.25	\$ 65	\$ 340.00			

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

<u>NAVB0001*</u>	\$ <u>295</u>	\$ 1.25	5	5 65	\$ <u>360.</u>	<u>က</u>
PRDS0001*	\$ 295	\$ 1.25	<u>.</u>	65	\$ <u>360</u> .	<u></u>
Knsnieue Authorized Bidder			<u>) (О</u> -С Гуре)			
Taykz Iv Company Name	ime LLC					
					73a -	253-
10 Box 1	<u>333 S.</u>	merset	W	08875	732- 7136	
Company Address	and Telephone	Number				
Wh-	ue_				6/1	123
Authorized Signati	ıre				7	Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost			
SINGLE ROUTES:							
ALCBY001	\$ 272	\$ 1.99	\$_ <i>V</i> A	<u>\$ 272</u>			
ALCED002*	\$ 189	\$ <u>.99</u>	\$ 50	\$ 239			
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$			
ALCKD002	\$ 358	\$ 1.99	\$_ <i>V</i> A_	\$ <u>358</u>			
CLLAD001*	\$	\$	\$	\$			
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$ <u>320</u>	\$ 1.99	\$ 40	\$ 360			
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ 91	\$ 1.99	\$_ <i>N</i> /A_	\$ 91			
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$ <u>91</u>	\$ 1.99	\$_ <i>VIA</i> _	\$ 91			

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District

Page 35 of 40

NAVB0001*	\$ 260 \$ 1.99	\$ 40 \$ 300
PRDS0001*	\$ 260 \$ 1.99	s 40 \$ 300
	VSV r's Name and Title (Print or Type)	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
Company Name	prothers	
-TS 1018/	AVE E-BNUNSUIC s and Telephone Number	KN38816
Authorized Signa		5/31/2023 Date

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES TO AND FROM SCHOOL

- Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted.
- The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only
- Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*
- Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal purposes.

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications.

Route No.	Route Per Diem	Inc/Dec Adj Cost	Aide/Attendant Per Diem Cost	Total Per Diem Cost
SINGLE ROUTE	<u>cs:</u>			
ALCBY001	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCED002*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCFR002S*	\$	\$	\$	\$
ALCKD002	\$	\$	\$	\$
CLLAD001*	. \$	\$	\$	\$
<u>CPC00001*</u>	\$	\$ <u>·</u>	\$	\$
<u>HM0018SA</u>	\$ <u> </u>	\$NA	\$ 0.90	\$ 84
<u>HM0019SA</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District Page 35 of 40

<u>NAVB0001*</u>	\$	\$	\$	\$
PRDS0001*	\$	\$	\$	\$
Authorized Bidde	r's Name and Titl	e (Print or Type	-Manag	
Company Name			adam en	·
Company Addres	San PLE s and Telephone 1	OSIBY Number	unsvict	, NS 08816
Authorized Signa		25		96-01-2023 Date